
NEAR HILTON HEAD ISLAND, SOUTH CAROLINA: 
Being awarded the 2024 “Carolina PGA Golf Professional 
of the Year,” Jason Sutton understands the nuances of a 
great golf instructor. “Since I started teaching more than 
25 years ago, the use of instructional aids has exploded,” 
stated Sutton. “We have migrated from two-dimensional 
video to wide-ranging analytical tools. The more you 
measure, the more you learn. The more you learn, the 
better you can understand how to improve.”

Jason has earned the nickname Guru. “I’m a vocif-
erous learner and strive to make my pupils play better. 
Being curious is an important trait that separates a great 
instructor from a good instructor,” continued Sutton.

For the past five years, Jason has been director of in-
struction at Colleton River Club. “If you are looking for 
a community designed from the ground up for golfers, 
look no further. Our facilities on and off the course are 
some of the finest in the world,” praised Sutton.

Water World

Colleton River Club is surrounded by water on three sides 
and bordered by a 1,100-acre nature preserve. “In my 
book, we are situated in the most beautiful place in the 
Lowcountry,” said Robert Sereci, CEO at Colleton River 
Club. “Our natural beauty, abundant wildlife, history, and 
culture thrive here. Having recently completed a $21.5 
million amenities enhancement project, the community is 
now situated to be one of the finest in the Lowcountry.” 

Amenities include Pete Dye and Jack Nicklaus Signature 
courses, a Bruce Borland par-3 short course, two modern 
clubhouses, including a beautiful rooftop lounge, a state-
of-the-art Sports & Wellness Complex, a Junior Olympic 
swimming pool, new Tennis Center, three bocce courts, 
and eight cushioned pickleball courts.

“Nature is our centerpiece,” concluded Sereci. “No-
where is that more evident than the four-mile drive from 
our entranceway to the Nicklaus Clubhouse. The roadway 
has a stunning canopy of moss-draped live oaks and pal-
metto trees. I like to refer to the drive as a decompression 
chamber from the outside world. Colleton River Club is 
the perfect community for those who want it all.” ■

For more information, please visit ColletonRiverClub.com. 

“This is the best course  
I have ever built.”  — PETE DYE

The Nicklaus Course

The Dye Course

The Guru at Work

What’s in a name? In the 1700s, several land-granted 
members of the Colleton family began to establish and develop 

the area originally called Footpoint Plantation.

“Our location is award-winning. Being nestled between 
Savannah and Charleston, both ranked in the ‘Top-10 Best 

Cities In The World,’ provides a laundry list of lifestyle choices.” 
— ROBERT SERECI, CEO AT COLLETON RIVER CLUB

Colleton River Club
The Golf Guru is 

in the House

https://www.colletonriverclub.com/

